From:
Sent:
To:
Subject: Re:

22 June 2010 21:32

I spoke to his office yesterday and they had no idea re. the printing,-then left me a voice mail asking
me to email him which I did with no reply.

I called the office again today but nobody was there, I will try again tomorrow!

Thanks,
On 22 Jun 2010, at 17:07, [ (IPSA) wrote:

See below. Aside from s other questions, which I'm trying to sort, he still seems to be having problems
accessing our webpage. - did you manage to speak to him in the end?

From:_ [mailto-@parliament.uk]

Sent: 22 June 2010 16:50
To: R (1PSA)
Subject:

oor [

| was able to book the [ last night for £90 but was told that it would be £150 the following night.
It seems strange that a hotel could charge such a wildly varying rate for the same room but there we are.

Averaged out over 2 nights this would still be within the £130 limit over the course of the whole stay so | wondered if
this would possible in future.

| tried all of the other hotels within easy reach of Westminister but was unable to get into any of the budget chains, or
any of the hotels which the House of Commons Travel office recomends,.for less than £130.
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I did investigate some of the hotels in the Victoria area but was not happy about what | saw. Unless | can be confident
that they are "respectable” I run the risk that when the receipts are published the newspapers will crawl over the
hotels and if they appear to be in any way "dubious" | will be the but of a great deal of innuendo.

| therefore decided to buy a camp-bed pillow and duvet and will use it to sleep on the floor office when other hotels
are not available. (not a problem for me | used to go camping every year anyway and at least | wont have to worry
about rain coming into the tent!)

I understand from the correspondance below that this is permissible, indeed it will save the tax payer a lot of money
so perhaps the newspapers will be happy.

I have one query. In my view this is clearly an accomadation expense and | would like it if possible to come out of the
accomadation budget not the General Administrative Expenditure. | would be grateful if you could consider this and let
me know if this is possible.

Secondly: | have submitted claims for hotel bills and travel costs going back to May but have not received any
payment yet. As you will understand the amounts of money which are going out of my personal bank account are
getting larger every day so | would be grateful for anything you could speed up payments.

Thirdly: The next major task will be for me to register my office. As you will be aware registering the car and my
London accomadation has taken many hours of phone calls and emails to IPSA and two hours of instructions from the
Parliamentary IT dept who say that the website you use is not compatible with all of the computers.

I am keen to try and ensure that registering the office is done as quickly as possible and have put aside a morning for
doing this on Thursday of this week. Would it be possible to email over a simple briefing on how to do this and what
documents will be required.

Regards -

The letter re the camp bed is re-produced below.
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Thank you for your e-mail of 24 May. I apologise for any delay in responding. In response to your query:

- You can purchase a camp bed and kettle, if you wish to stay at your office in Portcullis House. The costs
of the equipment can be classed as General Administrative Expenditure (see section 10.4 of the Scheme
which covers facilities, equipment and supplies). However we would suggest that you check with the House
of Commons that sleeping in your office is permissible (for fire and safety reasons) before proceeding with
your purchase.

I do hope this is helpful. If you have any further queries, please do not hesitate to contact us.
Kindest regards
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